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M Gma il Manas Upmanyu <manas.upmanyu@rkassociates.org>

Fwd: Supporting documents to be attested by Chartered Engineer

5 messages

Subhash Chandra Chauhan <subhash.chandra@rkassociates.org> Wed, Nov 9, 2022 at 3:13 PM
To: Manas Upmanyu <manas.upmanyu@rkassociates.org>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Megha Kumari <megha.kumari@c1india.com>

Date: Tue, 8 Nov 2022 at 4:55 PM

Subject: Supporting documents to be attested by Chartered Engineer

To: subhash.chandra@rkassociates.org <subhash.chandra@rkassociates.org>

CC: A Kundoo <a.kundoo@c1india.com>, Ramesh Bindroo <ramesh.bindroo@c1india.com>

Dear Sir,
Greetings!!

As per your discussion with Mr. Kundoo(cc’'d in email) PFA the documents which has to be attested by Chartered
Engineer.

Please provide the signed documents.
Please revert for any further clarification required.
Thank You.

Regards,
Megha Kumari
C1 India Private Limited

M:8102745326

Thanks & Regards,

Subhash Chandra Chauhan
Manager - Business Development

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=39d8a9415b&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1749011145174695601&simpl=msg-f%3A17490111451... 1/5
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VALUERS & TECHNG ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS (P)LTD.

i Valuation®
Intelligent
. System

World's first fully digital Automated Platform for
Integrating Valuation Life Cycle -
A product of R.K. Associates

R.K Associates Valuers & Techno Engineering Consultants (P) Ltd.,
Voice: 91-120-4324647, 4110117 Mobile: +91-9205353009

We assure our best services and response to you all the time.

In case of any concern regarding our services, you may refer to the escalation matrix below to reach out to my
manager/ supervisor or write to us at valuers@rkassociates.org regarding your concern.

First Level Escalation - Mr. Paramjit Kumar-
Sr. General Manager - paramjit. kumar@rkassociates.org - 9205353005
Second Level Escalation - Mr. Mohit Agarwal-

Sr. Vice President - mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org - 9999597597

Corporate Office:
D-39, Second Floor, Sector-2,
Noida Uttar Pradesh

Other Offices at: Ahmedabad | Dehradun | Bangalore | Shahjahanpur | Mumbai | Kolkata | Lucknow | Agra
Website: www.rkassociates.org

5 SAVE PAPER-SAVE TREE

Note : The e-mail content is intended for the sole use of the intended recipient/s and may contain material that

is CONFIDENTIAL AND PRIVATE COMPANY INFORMATION. Any review or reliance by others or copying or distribution
or forwarding of any or all of the contents in this message is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you have erroneously received
this message, please delete it immediately and notify the sender. Before opening any attachments please check them for
viruses and defects.

5 attachments

@ GNFC Agreement-2006(limited pages).pdf
1164K

@ GNFC Agreement-2014.pdf
577K

@ GNFC Certificate.pdf
323K

@ GNFC Latest Contract-2016.pdf
3401K

@ Tender Enquiries details.pdf
1240K
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Manas Upmanyu <manas.upmanyu@rkassociates.org> Thu, Nov 10, 2022 at 1:31 PM
To: Megha Kumari <megha.kumari@c1india.com>

Cc: Subhash Chandra Chauhan <subhash.chandra@rkassociates.org>, A Kundoo <a.kundoo@c1india.com>, Ramesh
Bindroo <ramesh.bindroo@c1india.com>, "Mohit Agarwal (Executive Sr. Vice President), R.K Associates"
<mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org>, Kirti Lakra <kirti.lakra@rkassociates.org>, "Business Operations R.K Associates"
<bo@rkassociates.org>, rka-vis@rkassociate.org

Dear Ma'am,
As per our telephonic conversation, here are the required documents for the attestation purpose:
¢ GNFC agreement dated 19th January 2006 (copies of all the 10 pages)
- We have received copies of only 4 pages of the above-said agreement.
* A copy of Letter of Intent or Work Order or any email communication regarding the Agreement produced to us

Please provide the above-mentioned documents for the respective documents to be attested.
Thanks & Regards,

Manas Upmanyu

Engineer - Valuations

REINFORCING YOUR BUSINESS®

ASSOCIATES

VALUERS & TECHNO ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS (P) LTD.

Valuation®
‘ Intelligent
. System

World's first fully digital Automated Platform for
Integrating Valuation Life Cycle -
A product of R.K. Associates
R.K Associates Valuers & Techno Engineering Consultants (P) Ltd.,
Mobile: +91-7838714258 | Voice: 0120-4110117

We assure our best services and response to you all the time.

In case of any concern regarding our services, you may refer to the escalation matrix below to reach out to my
manager/ supervisor or write to us at valuers@rkassociates.org regarding your concern.

First Level Escalation = — Mrs. Uttara Tyagi— Assistant Manager uttara.tyagi@rkassociates.org — 9205353003

Second Level Escalation — Mr. Mohit Agarwal- Vice President - mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org — 9999597597

Corporate Office:
D-39, 2nd Floor,
Sector-2, Noida- 201301 (Delhi NCR)

Other Offices at: Mumbai, Kolkata, Dehradun, Lucknow, Shahjahanpur

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=39d8a9415b&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1749011145174695601&simpl=msg-f%3A17490111451...  3/5
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Satellite office: Meerut, Agra, Ahmedabad, Bangalore

Website: www.rkassociates.org

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

Ramesh Bindroo <ramesh.bindroo@c1india.com> Thu, Nov 10, 2022 at 2:03 PM
To: Manas Upmanyu <manas.upmanyu@rkassociates.org>, Megha Kumari <megha.kumari@c1india.com>

Cc: Subhash Chandra Chauhan <subhash.chandra@rkassociates.org>, A Kundoo <a.kundoo@c1india.com>, "Mohit
Agarwal (Executive Sr. Vice President), R.K Associates" <mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org>, Kirti Lakra
<kirti.lakra@rkassociates.org>, "Business Operations R.K Associates" <bo@rkassociates.org>, "rka-vis@rkassociate.org"
<rka-vis@rkassociate.org>

Dear Manas Ji,

GNFC is our client since 2006 and the agreement was renewed in 2016. The 2016 agreement has already been shared
and that is the current agreement.

In addition customer certificate reinforcing that GNFC is our customer since 2006 has also been provided.

There hence should not be any reason to doubt etc.

I hereby, on behalf of C1 India Pvt Limited , as an authorized signatory (on behalf of Board of Directors) hereby
reiterate the above.

Hope fully this should enable you to do the attestation etc.

Kindly do the needful asap.

Thanks and Regards

Ramesh Bindroo

V.P - Sales - C1 India (P) Ltd | www.c1india.com
Plot No. 68, 3rd Floor, Sector-44,

Gurugram- 122003, Haryana
Direct: 0124-4302000-Ext-118 | Mobile: +91 9212104700 |

E-ramesh.bindroo@c1india.com
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[Quoted text hidden]

Manas Upmanyu <manas.upmanyu@rkassociates.org> Thu, Nov 10, 2022 at 2:55 PM

To: Sudhir Sharma <sudhir.sharma@rkassociates.org>
Cc: "Monhit Agarwal (Executive Sr. Vice President), R.K Associates" <mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org>, Subhash Chandra
Chauhan <subhash.chandra@rkassociates.org>

Dear Sir,
Please refer to the trailing e-mail as discussed.
Thanks and regards,

Manas Upmanyu
[Quoted text hidden]

Manas Upmanyu <manas.upmanyu@rkassociates.org> Thu, Nov 10, 2022 at 2:59 PM

To: Sudhir Sharma <sudhir.sharma@rkassociates.org>
Cc: "Mohit Agarwal (Executive Sr. Vice President), R.K Associates" <mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org>, Subhash Chandra
Chauhan <subhash.chandra@rkassociates.org>

Dear sir,
Please find the attached documents to be attested (for reference).

Thanks and regards,
Manas Upmanyu

[Quoted text hidden]

5 attachments

ﬂ GNFC Certificate.pdf
323K

ﬂ GNFC Latest Contract-2016.pdf
3401K

ﬂ Tender Enquiries details.pdf
1240K

ﬂ GNFC Agreement-2014.pdf
7719K

ﬂ GNFC Agreement-2006 (limited pages 4 out of 10).pdf
1164K
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