
From: Diptesh Ghosh <diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com> 

Sent on: Saturday, October 29, 2022 2:39:27 PM 

To: Shekhar Dahiya <shekhar.dahiya@pratap.co.in>; Monark 
Goel <monark_goel@adityagroup.com> 

CC: M. A. Johar <ma_johar@adityagroup.com>; ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR - OEM- TECHNO COMMERCIAL PROPOSAL II BSNL 
(MM/LWE/GBT-IaaSP/T-737/2022 ) || CP Plus 

    

 
Dear Shekhar Ji, 
  
Please find commercial as mentioned below: 
  
PTZ cameras as per RFP 

Sl. No.  Particulars UoM 
 BoM 

Qty 
Model No. Rate Am

3.05 
2 CCTV Cameras at each 

site including 64GB SD card 

and 4G module 
Set(s) 22,712 

CP-UNP-C1021L3G - PTZ Camera x 2 

Nos. 
25600 58,14

  
  
Option #1: VMS at central location with storage for 30 days @D1 resolution considering camera 

quantity as per RFP (i.e., 45424 cameras) 
Sl. 

No. 
 Particulars UoM 

 BoM 

Qty 
Model No. Rate Amoun

  Central Site         

1 

VMS Camera Licence, VMS 

Base License, NAS for 

Central Storage (For 

Storage of all Cameras at 

D1@ 25 fps for 30 Days 

recording) including 

Surveillance HDD 10TB 

each 

Set(s) 1 EVMS Pro with license and NAS 13,15,83,500 13,15,83,5

  
  
Option #2: VMS at central location with storage for 30 days @D1 resolution considering license 

quantity camera as per RFP (i.e., 60000 cameras) 
Sl. 

No. 
 Particulars UoM 

 BoM 

Qty 
Model No. Rate Amoun

  Central Site         

1 

VMS Camera Licence, VMS 

Base License, NAS for 

Central Storage (For 

Storage of all Cameras at 

D1@ 25 fps for 30 Days 

Set(s) 1 EVMS Pro with license and NAS 13,89,33,500 13,89,33,5



recording) including 

Surveillance HDD 10TB 

each 
  
  
Terms & Conditions :- 
  

1. Taxes Extra as pplicable 

2. Warranty : 3 Years. For Extra warranty please consider 7% Extra per year. 

3. Delivery : 3~4 Months after confirmed P.O 

4. Payment : 60 Days LC along with P.O 

  
  
Regards, 
-- 
Diptesh Ghosh | AGM Pre-sales 
  
Aditya Infotech Limited 
Office: +91 120 455 5666 | Diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com 
Cell: +91 88601 59247 | +91 98300 17865 
  
From: Shekhar Dahiya <shekhar.dahiya@pratap.co.in> 

Sent: 29 October 2022 18:39 

To: Diptesh Ghosh <diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com>; Monark Goel 

<monark_goel@adityagroup.com> 

Cc: M. A. Johar <ma_johar@adityagroup.com>; ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR - OEM- TECHNO COMMERCIAL PROPOSAL II BSNL (MM/LWE/GBT-IaaSP/T-

737/2022 ) || CP Plus 
  
Hi Ghosh ji / Goel ji, 
  
Please share quotation before 7 pm ...kindly treat this urgent ... 
  
Warm Regards 
  
Shekhar Dahiya 
+91-9251644755 
  
From: Shekhar Dahiya [mailto:shekhar.dahiya@pratap.co.in] 

Sent: 29 October 2022 14:33 

To: 'Diptesh Ghosh' <diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com> 

Cc: 'M. A. Johar' <ma_johar@adityagroup.com>; 'ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in' 

<ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in>; 'Monark Goel' <monark_goel@adityagroup.com> 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR - OEM- TECHNO COMMERCIAL PROPOSAL II BSNL (MM/LWE/GBT-IaaSP/T-

737/2022 ) || CP Plus 
  
Hi Ghosh ji / Goel ji, 
  
Please share quotation latest by 3 pm .... 
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Warm Regards 
  
Shekhar Dahiya 
+91-9251644755 
  
From: Diptesh Ghosh [mailto:diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com] 

Sent: 29 October 2022 14:30 

To: Shekhar Dahiya <shekhar.dahiya@pratap.co.in> 

Cc: M. A. Johar <ma_johar@adityagroup.com>; ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in; Monark Goel 

<monark_goel@adityagroup.com> 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR - OEM- TECHNO COMMERCIAL PROPOSAL II BSNL (MM/LWE/GBT-IaaSP/T-

737/2022 ) || CP Plus 
  
PFA LC document.. 
  
Regards, 
-- 
Diptesh Ghosh | AGM Pre-sales 
  
Aditya Infotech Limited 
Office: +91 120 455 5666 | Diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com 
Cell: +91 88601 59247 | +91 98300 17865 
  
From: Diptesh Ghosh 

Sent: 28 October 2022 13:28 

To: Shekhar Dahiya <shekhar.dahiya@pratap.co.in> 

Cc: M. A. Johar <ma_johar@adityagroup.com>; ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in; Monark Goel 

<monark_goel@adityagroup.com> 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR - OEM- TECHNO COMMERCIAL PROPOSAL II BSNL (MM/LWE/GBT-IaaSP/T-

737/2022 ) || CP Plus 
  
Dear Shekhar, 
  
Please find a copy of undertaking of LC enclosed herewith for your reference. 
  
As an OEM the undertaking of LC has been issued with 22% of LC in the proposed product as Class-

II local supplier. As the major component of this tender is fabrication and erection of telecom 

towers, the bidder may claim LC 50% or above for Class-I local supplier based on other components 

involved in this tender. 
  
Regards, 
-- 
Diptesh Ghosh | AGM Pre-sales 
  
Aditya Infotech Limited 
Office: +91 120 455 5666 | Diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com 
Cell: +91 88601 59247 | +91 98300 17865 
  
From: Monark Goel <monark_goel@adityagroup.com> 

Sent: 27 October 2022 19:13 

To: Shekhar Dahiya <shekhar.dahiya@pratap.co.in>; Diptesh Ghosh <diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com> 
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Cc: M. A. Johar <ma_johar@adityagroup.com>; ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR - OEM- TECHNO COMMERCIAL PROPOSAL II BSNL (MM/LWE/GBT-IaaSP/T-

737/2022 ) || CP Plus 
  
  

12. CCTV OEM (CP PLUS ) MAF : Attached 
  

  
  
Thanks 
  
Monark Goel 
+91-8860080212 
  
From: Monark Goel 

Sent: 27 October 2022 01:48 PM 

To: Shekhar Dahiya <shekhar.dahiya@pratap.co.in>; Diptesh Ghosh <diptesh_ghosh@adityagroup.com> 

Cc: M. A. Johar <ma_johar@adityagroup.com>; ashish.thakur@pratap.co.in 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR - OEM- TECHNO COMMERCIAL PROPOSAL II BSNL (MM/LWE/GBT-IaaSP/T-

737/2022 ) || CP Plus 
  
Dear Team, 
  
Greetings …!!! 
  
Thanks for sharing your inquiry with us. Please find the below documents attached :- 
  

1. Technical Compliance : Attached 
2. Product Datasheets 

a. CP-UNP-C1021L3G - Attached 
b. CP-GR-DE413-S - https://www.cpplusworld.com/prodassets/datasheet/CP-GR-DE413-

S.pdf 
c. CP-NM64            - https://www.cpplusworld.com/prodassets/datasheet/CP-NM32-

NM64-NM128.pdf 
d. CP-UVS-6487R   - Attached 
e. EVMS Pro           - Attached 

  

3. UL Certificate    : Attached 
4. BIS Certificate for Camera : Attached 
5. ISO Certificates : Attached 
6. CE, FCC & RoHS Certificate : https://www.cpplusworld.com/prodassets/certificate/85f017cd-

c1c8-4cf3-b546-e3ec4721ea2e.rar 
7. GFR Undertaking : Attached 
8. Self-certificate for non-Blacklisting         : Attached 
9. OEM should have deployed (directly or through any SI) minimum 5000 Nos CCTV Cameras in 

India. ( PO / Work Order document required )  …..P.O Copy and Supply confirmation Attached 
10. OEM shall have operation in India. ( Certificate of Incorporation )  -- Attached 
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11. Unpriced BoQ : - 
  

Sl. 

No. 
 Particulars 

 Total 

Qty 
 Unit Model No. 

  
Supply and 

installation of 

items 
      

3.05 
2 CCTV 
Cameras at each 
site 

22,712 

Sets CP-UNP-C1021L3G - PTZ Camera x 2 Nos. 

Nos 
CP-GR-DE413-S  - 4G Router with 4 
Ethernet Port 

Sets CP-NM64 - 64GB SD Card x 2 Nos. 

  Central Site       

1 
VMS Camera 
Licence 

60,000 
Licens

es 
EVMS Pro Camera License 

2 
VMS Base 
License 

1 Set EVMS Pro Base License x 2 Nos. 

3 

Central Storage 
(For Storage of 
all Cameras at 
D1@ 25 fps for 
30 Days 
recording) 

8 Nos. CP-UVS-6487R 

4 
10TB  Surveilla
nce HDD 

384 Nos   

          

  
For any other details please let us know. 
  
  
Jai Hind !!! 
  

 
  




