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Shreyash Shetty <shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org>

Sintex BAPL Ltd/Enterprise Valuation


Agm2others1 Sarg <agm2others1.sarg@sbi.co.in> Sat, Jul 30, 2022 at 2:28 PM
To: Gaurav Kumar <gaurav.kumar@rkassociates.org>, Shreyash Shetty <shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org>

Dear Sir,

 

You are request to go ahead with the preparation of Enterprise valuation of the captioned account and submit the
reports at the earliest.

 

Thanks & Regards

 

Rohit Arora

Chief Manager

AMT 4, Non Infra 2

Stressed Assets Resolution Group (SARG)

Corporate
Centre, Mumbai

Ph: 022-68247654 / 9453007585

 

 

On Wed, Jul 27, 2022 at 11:57 AM Shreyash Shetty <shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org> wrote:

Dear Sir,

 

Greetings of the Day.!!

 

As per our telephonic discussion,

The Quotation for the Enterprise Valuation on the basis of Net Asset Value Method and Current Asset Valuation (as
on dated 31/03/2022 & 30/06/2022) will be
Rs. 3,80,000+GST.

 

We find this quote quite reasonable for this particular scope of work.

 

Request you to kindly give us your approval through a formal work order.

 

In case of any other query, please feel free to contact the undersigned.

 

With Deep Regards,

mailto:shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org
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Shreyash Shetty

Assistant Manager.
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