
2/23/23, 2:21 PM Rkassociates.org Mail - Quotation for Valuation Of Project

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=51fe8cef20&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1758349126060009570&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f%3A1758349126060009570 1/3

Shreyash Shetty <shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org>

Quotation for Valuation Of Project
Payal Shah <payal@grubstakefs.com> Mon, Feb 20, 2023 at 4:56 PM
To: Shreyash Shetty <shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org>
Cc: Abhishek Shanbhag <abhishek.shanbhag@rkassociates.org>, rka-vis@rkassociate.org, "Business Operations R.K Associates" <bo@rkassociates.org>, Abhinav Chaturvedi
<abhinav.chaturvedi@rkassociates.org>, Jinesh Parekh <jinesh@grubstakefs.com>, Krisha Somani <krisha@grubstakefs.com>

Hi Shreyash Ji,

With reference to trail mail, we approve the quotation 50% payment will be made by the client and balance will be made after the signed report.
Kindly find the enclosed herewith GST certificate and raise the invoice for the same. Also share the list of documents required for the valuation Report.

Regards

Payal Shah

On Mon, Feb 20, 2023 at 3:08 AM Shreyash Shetty <shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org> wrote:
Dear Madam,

Greetings for the day!

Thank you for contacting R.K Associates (India’s leading and trusted Valuation company) for your Valuation requirement.

In this regard as per the details provided to us, please find our revised quotation as per the attached audited report datasheet and the summary below:

1. Name of the Account : M/s. Ruby Lifespaces 
2. Coordinating Person Name: Krisha Madam
3. Purpose of the assignment: For New Loan purpose
4. Number of Assets to be valued: 01
5. Type of Asset: Project Valuation (Residential L&B)  
6. Location: Naigaon West, Vasai, Palghar
7. Total Estimated Fees: Rs. 25,000 + GST 
8. Advance Amount to be Paid: 100%
9. Payment condition: Remaining within 7 days after submission of final report

After approval of the quotation, we will begin the work on the assignment. Request you to kindly share us the UTR Details once the payment is released.

We assure you that we will try our level best to clarify all your concerns/ doubts up to your satisfaction.

With Deep Regards,

mailto:shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org
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Shreyash Shetty
Assistant Manager.

R.K Associates Valuers & Techno Engineering Consultants Pvt. Ltd.
È+91-8369749928 I +91-8108387252, ( 91-1204324647 | +91-1204110117

===============================================================================

 

We assure our best services and response to you all the time.

 

In case of any concern regarding our services, you may refer to the escalation matrix below to reach out to my manager / supervisor or write to us
at valuers@rkassociates.org regarding your concern.

 

First Level Escalation - Mrs. Uttara Tyagi - Assistant Manager BO - uttara.tyagi@rkassociates.org - +91-8077455830

Second Level Escalation - Mr. Paramjit Kumar - Sr. General Manager - paramjit.kumar@rkassociates.org - +91-9892318899

Corporate Office:
D-39, 2nd Floor, Sector-2,
Noida (Delhi NCR)-201301.

Mumbai Regional Office:
Office no. 1212, 12th Floor,
Sunshine Tower, Senapati Bapat Marg,
Dadar West, Mumbai - 400013.

Kolkata Regional Office:
Office No.912, Delta House
4, Government Place(North),
Opp. Raj Bhawan, Kolkata, W.B-700001.

mailto:valuers@rkassociates.org
mailto:uttara.tyagi@rkassociates.org
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Other Offices at: Dehradun | Pune | Lucknow | Hyderabad

*: valuers.mum@rkassociates.org I shreyash.shetty@rkassociates.org
Website: www.rkassociates.org

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Note: The email content is intended for the sole use of the intended recipient/s and may contain material that is CONFIDENTIAL AND PRIVATE COMPANY
INFORMATION. Any review or reliance by others or copying or distribution or forwarding of any or all of the contents in this message is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you
have erroneously received this message, please delete it immediately and notify the sender. Before opening any attachments please check them for viruses and defects.

On Thu, Feb 2, 2023 at 3:33 PM Payal Shah <payal@grubstakefs.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

As discussed over the phone kindly find the following documents and send the quotation for the same.

Regards,
Krisha

RUBY LIFESPACES GST Certificate.pdf
138K
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