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M Gma i | Kishanu Sarkar <kishanu.sarkar@rkassociate.org>

Fwd: Fw: Requirement for the valuation report of Plant & Machinery for M/s
Andri Agro Foods Pvt Ltd

2 messages

Tarun Ghosh <tarun.ghosh@rkassociates.org> 22 August 2024 at 19:10
To: rajat Choudhary <rajat.choudhary@rkassociate.org>, kishanu sarkar <kishanu.sarkar@rkassociate.org>
Cc: "Business Operations R.K Associates" <bo@rkassociates.org>, RKA VIS <rka-vis@rkassociate.org>

Team
Pl do the needful.

With deep Regards,

Tarun Ghosh.

Regional Manager-Business Development
[ REIMFORCING YOUR BUSINESS

ASSOCIATES"

VALUERS & TECHNO ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS (P} LTD,

Powered by:

“ Valuation
\ Intelligent
. System

World's first fully digital Automated Platform for
Integrating Valuation Life Cycle -
A product of R.K. Associates
www.valuationintelligentsystem.com

Mobile: +91-8588823177,9958632707 | Voice: +91-120 4110117; 4324647
R.K Associates Valuers & Techno Engineering Consultants (P) Ltd.,

Corporate Office: D-39, 2nd Floor, Sector-2, Noida-201301 (Delhi NCR)

Kolkata Office Address: Smartpave Corporate Centre Saberwal House, 8th Floor 55B Mirza Galib Street (Near
Park Mansion) Kolkata- 700 016, West Bengal

Website: www.rkassociates.org

Other Offices at: Mumbai, Dehradun, Lucknow, Shahjahanpur
Satellite & shared office: Ahemedabad, Bangaluru, Meerut, Agra

We assure our best services and response to you all the time.

In case of any concern regarding our services, you may refer to the escalation matrix below to reach out
to my manager/ supervisor or write to us at valuers@rkassociates.org regarding your concern.

First Level Escalation —Mr.Paramjit Kumar — Sr.general Manager-Business Development Engagement &
operation --Paramjit. kumar@rkassociates.org-- +97 9205353005.

Second Level Escalation — Mr.Mohit Agarwal - Sr. Vice President (Projects, Business Strategy & Planning
Group),- mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org-- +971-999959759.

Note : The e-mail content is intended for the sole use of the intended recipient/s and may contain material that is
CONFIDENTIAL AND PRIVATE COMPANY INFORMATION. Any review or reliance by others or copying or
distribution or forwarding of any or all of the contents in this message is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you have
erroneously received this message, please delete it immediately and notify the sender. Before opening any
attachments please check them for viruses and defects.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: DURGAPUR CITY CENTRE <CITYCENTRE.DURGAPUR@indianbank.co.in>

Date: Thu, Aug 22, 2024 at 7:00 PM

Subject: Fw: Requirement for the valuation report of Plant & Machinery for M/s Andri Agro Foods Pvt Ltd
To: tarun.ghosh@rkassociates.org <tarun.ghosh@rkassociates.org>
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Classification: Internal

HTgr Y=gddlq¢ / Thanks & Regards,

Sf3UT 9 (SATETAIE) / INDIAN BANK (ALLAHABAD)
CITY CENTRE BRANCH, DURGAPUR

UNDER ZONAL OFFICE ASANSOL
Telephone : (0343) 2542148
E-Mail :D690@indianbank.co.in

This message has been classified as Internal

From: DURGAPUR CITY CENTRE

Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2024 6:59 PM

To: tarun.ghosh@rkassiciates.org <tarun.ghosh@rkassiciates.org>

Subject: Requirement for the valuation report of Plant & Machinery for M/s Andri Agro Foods Pvt Ltd

Dear Sir,

We have financed Rs. 177. Lakh for the setup of 3D Papar Machinery for the above-mentioned firm.
We require a valuation report for this.

Please contract with Mr. Raja Baranwal (Director), Contract No : 8371030865.

HlgY YUdlg / Thanks & Regards,

ST 9 (SATETAIE) / INDIAN BANK (ALLAHABAD)
CITY CENTRE BRANCH, DURGAPUR

UNDER ZONAL OFFICE ASANSOL

Telephone : (0343) 2542148

E-Mail :D690@indianbank.co.in

Please do not print this email unless it is absolutely necessary

The information contained in this electronic message and any attachments to this message are intended for the exclusive use of
the addressee(s) and may contain proprietary, confidential or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you
should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately in case you are not the intended
recipient and destroy all copies of this message and any attachments. Any form of reproduction, dissemination, copying,
disclosure, modification, distribution and / or publication of this message without the prior written consent of authorized
representative of Indian Bank is strictly prohibited. Views or opinions, if any, presented in this email are solely those of the
author and may not necessarily reflect the views or opinions of Indian Bank or its affiliates

WARNING: The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The bank accepts no liability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email

www.indianbank.in

Rajat Choudhary <rajat.choudhary@rkassociate.org> 26 August 2024 at 15:31
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