
Shahid . <shahid@rkassociates.org>

Re: Land & Building valuation Report
2 messages

Shahid . <shahid@rkassociates.org> Tue, Sep 24, 2024 at 12:58 PM
To: gastrading@zakventure.com, Kashif Hasan <md@zakventure.com>
Cc: "R.K Associates, The Valuers | LIE | TEV | ASM" <valuers@rkassociates.org>, "Business Operations R.K Associates"
<bo@rkassociates.org>, "Mohit Agarwal (Executive Sr. Vice President), R.K Associates" <mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org>

Dear Sir,

The revised professional fees will be Rs. 15,000/- + GST (Excluding Visit Expenses) It is requested to make 50% payment
before site survey

On Tue, 24 Sept, 2024, 12:05 pm Shahid ., <shahid@rkassociates.org> wrote:
Dear Sir,

As per the details provided by you in the trail mail for the valuation Report of Ghaziabad Bio Gas Plant . The professional
fees captioned assignment will be Rs. 35,000/- + GST (Excluding Visit Expenses) It is requested to make 50% payment
before site survey. (Because company has to make arrangements or expenses as per actuals) company account
detailed attached.
 
Please acknowledge the same over the mail so that we can proceed further

On Mon, Sep 23, 2024 at 12:12 PM gastrading@zakventure.com <gastrading@zakventure.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Please ignore the previous mail.

Kindly provide the land valuation report for the attached land details (Gaziabad Plant).

Regards,
Fuzail
9958667797

From: gastrading@zakventure.com <gastrading@zakventure.com>
Sent: Monday, September 23, 2024 12:01 PM
To: shahid@rkassociates.org <shahid@rkassociates.org>
Cc: md@zakventure.com <md@zakventure.com>
Subject: TEV Report
 
Dear sir,

Refer to our telephonic discussion we are sharing here land documents for the Gaziabad Bio-Gas plant,
kindly provide the TEV report for State bank of India.
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Regards,
Fuzail
9958667797

--

Thanks & Regards,
Mohd Shahid,
Senior Coordinator Business Operation
+91-9350027216
__________________________________________________

Mobile: +91-9350027216 |  Voice: 91-120-4110117, 4324647
R.K Associates Valuers & Techno Engineering Consultants (P) Ltd.,

Corporate Office: - 
D-39, Second Floor, Sector-2, 
Noida, Uttar Pradesh-201301
Website: www.rkassociates.org

Md Fuzail <gastrading@zakventure.com> Tue, Sep 24, 2024 at 1:46 PM
To: "Shahid ." <shahid@rkassociates.org>
Cc: Kashif Hasan <md@zakventure.com>, "R.K Associates, The Valuers | LIE | TEV | ASM" <valuers@rkassociates.org>,
"Business Operations R.K Associates" <bo@rkassociates.org>, "Mohit Agarwal (Executive Sr. Vice President), R.K
Associates" <mohit.agarwal@rkassociates.org>

Dear Mr Shahid,

As per our discussion make it 12000 and schedule the visit.

Regards 
Fuzail 

Sent from Android device
[Quoted text hidden]
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Shahid . <shahid@rkassociates.org>

TEV Report
3 messages

gastrading@zakventure.com <gastrading@zakventure.com> Mon, Sep 23, 2024 at 12:01 PM
To: "shahid@rkassociates.org" <shahid@rkassociates.org>
Cc: "md@zakventure.com" <md@zakventure.com>

Dear sir,

Refer to our telephonic discussion we are sharing here land documents for the Gaziabad Bio-Gas plant,
kindly provide the TEV report for State bank of India.

Regards,
Fuzail
9958667797

Gaziabad CBG Plant.zip
18524K

gastrading@zakventure.com <gastrading@zakventure.com> Mon, Sep 23, 2024 at 12:12 PM
To: "shahid@rkassociates.org" <shahid@rkassociates.org>
Cc: "md@zakventure.com" <md@zakventure.com>

Dear Sir,

Please ignore the previous mail.

Kindly provide the land valuation report for the attached land details (Gaziabad Plant).

Regards,
Fuzail
9958667797

From: gastrading@zakventure.com <gastrading@zakventure.com>
Sent: Monday, September 23, 2024 12:01 PM
To: shahid@rkassociates.org <shahid@rkassociates.org>
Cc: md@zakventure.com <md@zakventure.com>
Subject: TEV Report
 
[Quoted text hidden]
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